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ALC instructors and tutors: 
One-to-one tutoring, 

Supplemental Instruction, 
Course-based writing, Training 

for tutor/leaders, workshops

Career Services: Career plan-
ning and development, career 
mentor program, job search 
assistance, Career Compass.

Promotion of services, 
programs and events to 

support student success while 
helping to amplify diversity to 

student voices

Programs and instruction for 
students whose first language 

is not English.

Intensive academic 
English programs.

Part-time courses

Tailored offerings

International student advising, 
welcome and transition 

programming.

Intercultural experiences and 
programming.

Student exchange and mobility
Resources: International  

pre-departure orientation. 

First Year Centre/University 1: 
New student academic advising 

hub, orientation, supports for 
special populations.

Student Transition Coordinator: 
programming to remove 

barriers to success.
Resource: Charge Ahead

University Advising 
Coordinator: supports 

initiatives to enhance advising. 

Virtual Advising Help Centre: 
peer to peer support 7 days/

week

Resources: First Year Planning 
Guide, Bison+ program, UM 
Connect, UM Essentials, UM 

Learn Course; 

Military Support: supports 
Canadian Regular and 

Reserve Forces, retired 
members, civilian employees 
of the Department of National 

Defence

Community Engaged Learning: 
Local and global community 

service programs, ethical 
and reciprocal community 

engagement.
Resource: Working in Good 

Ways: a framework and 
resources.

Student Life: Student 
involvement, mentorship and 

leadership programming, 
recognition

Experiential Learning 
Partnerships: Supports the 

experiential learning initiative.

ARTS 1110 (introduction to 
University): Interdisciplinary 

first year seminar course.

Academic Integrity 
Coordinator: UM academic 

integrity initiative, triage 
education and remediation.

Resources: Academic Integrity 
site, Post Discipling education.


